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TITLE 29--LABOR 
  
CHAPTER XVII--OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ADMINISTRATION,  

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 
  
PART 1910--OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH STANDARDS (CONTINUED)— 
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                Subpart Z--Toxic and Hazardous Substances 
  
Sec. 1910.1200  Hazard communication. 
 
      4.  Preparing and Implementing a Hazard Communication Program 
 
                  A.  Labels and Other Forms of Warning 
 
    In-plant containers of hazardous chemicals must be labeled, tagged, or marked with the 
identity of the material and appropriate hazard warnings. Chemical manufacturers, importers, 
and distributors are required to ensure that every container of hazardous chemicals they ship  
is appropriately labeled with such information and with the name and address of the producer or 
other responsible party. Employers purchasing chemicals can rely on the labels provided by their 
suppliers. If the material is subsequently transferred by the employer from a labeled container to 
another container, the employer will have to label that container unless it is subject to the 
portable container exemption. See paragraph (f) of this section for specific labeling requirements. 
    The primary information to be obtained from an OSHA-required label is an identity for the 
material, and appropriate hazard warnings. The identity is any term which appears on the label, 
the MSDS, and the list of chemicals, and thus links these three sources of information. The 
identity used by the supplier may be a common or trade name (``Black Magic Formula''), or a 
chemical name (1,1,1,-trichloroethane). The hazard warning is a brief statement of the hazardous 
effects of the chemical (``flammable,'' ``causes lung damage''). Labels frequently contain other 
information, such as precautionary measures (``do not use near open flame''), but this 
information is provided voluntarily and is not required by the rule. Labels must be legible, and 
prominently displayed. There are no specific requirements for size or color, or any specified text. 
    With these requirements in mind, the compliance officer will be looking for the following 
types of information to ensure that labeling will be properly implemented in your facility: 
    1. Designation of person(s) responsible for ensuring labeling of in-plant containers; 
    2. Designation of person(s) responsible for ensuring labeling of any shipped containers; 
    3. Description of labeling system(s) used; 
    4. Description of written alternatives to labeling of in-plant containers (if used); and, 
    5. Procedures to review and update label information when necessary. 



    Employers that are purchasing and using hazardous chemicals--rather than producing or 
distributing them--will primarily be concerned with ensuring that every purchased container is 
labeled. If materials are transferred into other containers, the employer must ensure that these are 
labeled as well, unless they fall under the portable container exemption (paragraph (f)(7) of this 
section). In terms of labeling systems, you can simply choose to use the labels provided by your 
suppliers on the containers. These will generally be verbal text labels, and do not usually include 
numerical rating systems or symbols that require special training. The most important thing to 
remember is that this is a continuing duty--all in-plant containers of hazardous chemicals must 
always be labeled. Therefore, it is important to designate someone to be responsible for ensuring 
that the labels are maintained as required on the containers in your facility, and that newly 
purchased materials are checked for labels prior to use. 
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